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OP AQUATICS                       
Bidder Specified Brand 

Name
Item 

Number
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1 1/2 Ele Jam Nut 1 Each Zoro 1LVG9 Each Each $6.99 No
2 84-10020 1/2 in - Close Nipple - Sch 80 1 Each 84-10020 each each 2.53$                                            Harrington Plastics 882-cl Each Each 1.88 No
3 89-20070 1/4 in. - Tubing Per Foot - CP 10 Each 89-20070 per ft per ft 6.38$                                            Finger Lakes Polyflex 875-8281 Per Foot Coil $0.33 No 43075 ea foot 0.60$                              N
4 52-99140 1000 Watt Par 64 Lamp 10 Each 52-99140 each each 99.50$                                         special order & shipping Philipsn or GE PAR64 Per Each Per Each $45.00 No
5 116 12# Balance Pak 300-Calcium 19 Each ideal water hardness 10-08000 each per pail 38.30$                                         brand we carry Bio Guard 52220BIO Per Bag 12lb Bag $23.99 No
6 177 12.5% Liquid Chlorine (4x1 gal) 502 Gallon 10-03050 gallon 4/1 gal/per caes 4.08$                                            Champion CHPS41 Case 4gal/case $14.00 No Pool Brite 84820 gallon 4 X 1 Case 2.70 per gallon N
7 185 25# Balance Pak 100-Alkalinity 2 Each alk increaser 25# pail 10-20040 each per pail 36.70$                                         brand we carry Bio Guard 23417BIO Per Pail 25lb Pail $34.99 No Pool Brite 48990 pail 25# 18.00$                            N
8 120 25# Chlor Out-CL2 Neutralizer 10 Each Anhydraous sod thiosulfate 50#   10-10-03073 each bag 50# bag 110.93$                                       brand we carry Misc Vendor SODTHIOS Per Bag 50lb Bag $94.00 No Pool Brite 84808 pail 25# 44.00$                            N
9 158 25# Diatomaceous Earth 4 Each 25# box D.E. 10-05010 25#box 25#box 29.97$                                         brand we carry EP Minerals DE25BX Per Box 25lb Box $39.75 No Celaton 85998 bag 25# 9.25$                              N

10 25# Oxy-Klear 1 Each 25# Non Chl Shock 10-19035 pail each 99.75$                                         Swimmers Advantage P8705059N Per Pail 50lb Pail $230.00 No Pool Brite 84966 pail 25# 74.25$                            N
11 80-06510 3/4" Female - SCH 1 Each 80-06510 each each 6.43$                                            Harrington Plastics 835-007 per Each Per Each $2.61 No
12 82-21032 3/4" x 1/2in Reducer - T X T Sch 40 1 Each 82-21032 each each 7.51$                                            Harrington Plastics 437-101 Per Each Per Each $1.18 No
13 400C Link Seal 12 Each 81-12020 per piece each 34.38$                                         Link Seal LS-400-C Per Link Per Link $24.00 No
14 10-23035 ACCUTAB - 55# 240 Each Axial-Accutab blue 10-23035 pail per/55# pail 145.00$                                       Pulsar Per Pail 50lb Pail $135.00 Yes, Alternate Product
15 10-01000 Acid - Muriatic - Gal 140 Each 10-01000 gallon 4/1 bal/ per case 4.92$                                            Misc Vendor CH416 Case 4gal/case $24.00 No Buckmans 84900 gallon 4 X 1 Case 3.25 -per gallon N
16 10-01015 Acid Magic - Per Gallon 63 Gallon 10-01015 gallon 4/1 gal/ per case 7.50$                                            Certol ACIDMAG Case 4gal/case $31 No Buckmans 84904 gallon 4 X 1 Case 8.00 per gallon N
17 25-25040 Anti-Rattle Clamp 2 Each durafirm 25-25040 each each 35.63$                                         No Bid
18 Brass Comp Nuts - 1/4" 2 Each misc each each 12.99$                                         Everbilt 800929 Pack 3pc Pack $8.51 No
19 Brass Ferrules - 1/4" 2 Each misc each each 12.99$                                         Everbilt 801049 pack 3pc Pack 7.8 No

20 39-00103 Cable: Swivel Assy Dynamic 35' 1 Each maytronics 39-00103 each each 454.50$                                       we are authurized repair center 
for MI

No Bid

21 Calcium Chloride 50# 10 Each dow 10-08025 50# bag each 28.35$                                         Occidental Chemical Corp CALCHLOR50 Bag 50lb Bag $29.00 No Buckmans 84799 bag 50# 18.50$                            N
22 2100 Chemtrol 2100 w/flow cell/flow switch 1 Each santa barbra controls special order each each 3,950.50$                                   Chemtrol PC2100 $4,250.00 Yes, Optional Product Santa Barbara 42206 ea 1 2,800.00$                      N
23 36-16047 Chemtrol PPM Gel 2 Each santa barbra controls 36-16047 each each 115.92$                                       Chemtrol PPMGEL1B Per Each Per Each $145.00 No Santa Barbara 43189 ea 1 110.50$                         N
24 36-16046 Chemtrol PPM Membrane 2 Each santa barbra controls 36-16046 each each 252.00$                                       Chemtrol PPMMEM1B Per Each Per Each $334.00 No Santa Barbara 43190 ea 1 249.60$                         N
25 25-20000 Clamp - Rails S.S 1 Each durafirm 25-20000 each each 26.77$                                         DuraFlex 43114 Each Per Each $24.75 No
26 36-16201 Co2 Diffuser Assembly 1 Each becs technology 36-16201 each each 124.15$                                       Neptune Benson 145NBC02DF Per Each Per Each $89.00 No Neptune Benson 55061 ea 1 560.00$                         N
27 36-16205 Co2 Flow Meter 3-30 1 Each dwyer instruments 36-16205 each each 181.74$                                       Dwyer 5-50 SCFH Flow Control Meter Per Each Per Each $200.00 No

28 36-16021 Compression Fitting - 1/4" MPT x 3/8" Tube 1 Each 36-16021 each each 9.09$                                            Jaco 10-6-4-P-PG Per Each Per Each $2.50 No

29 52-99205 Global R-375 Lift Battery Cover 1 Each global lift 52-99205 each each 49.95$                                         Global Lift 910-1000T Per Each Per Each $75.00 No
30 10-23000 Ideal - Algaecide 60-Qt 24 Each ideal 10-23000 Qt each 23.63$                                         Bio Guard All 60 23060BIO Quart Per Quart $27.50 No Pool Brite 84912 bottle 1 Quart 11.00$                            N
31 10-16015 IDEAL - Ph Increaser 20# 4 Each Ideal 10-16015 20# pail each 31.20$                                         Azure 681027355 25lb Pail Per Pail $35.00 No
32 35-40036 I'Kerrick Valve Rebuild Kit 1 Each PurAqua 35-40036 each each 81.07$                                         Kerick 9500200 Per Each Per Each $51.15 No

33 Labor Charge to Install New Chemtrol 2100 1 Each 500.00$                                       $500.00 No

34 52-99141 Lens Gasket for Hydrel Lights 48 Each hydrel 52-92462 each each 101.91$                                       Pentair Pool 05601-0014 Per Each Per Each $35.00 No
35 35-13060 MA - Drain Valve 1 Each 35-13060 each each 89.73$                                         No Bid
36 39-00361 MU DIAG - 2006 6H EX 1 Each Maytronics 39-00361 each each 381.19$                                       No Bid
37 151 Muriatic Acid (15 gal carboy) 870 Gallon 10-01020 each 15 gal drum 68.60$                                         25 deposit &epa fee Sunbelt Chemical Corp MA15 15 gallon Carboy 9/Pallet $139.00 No Buckmans 84903 barrel 15 gallon drum 76.00$                            N
38 Obr-3 Pool Enzymes Pro 5 gallon pail 1 Pail 10-23042 5 gal pail each 198.50$                                       Great Lakes Bio Systems M411-000-5G 5 Gallon Barrel Each $225.00 No NC Brands 84450 drum 5 gallon 170.00$                         N
39 35-20068 Polyflex Tubing - 3/8 OD x 1/4 ID 4 Foot 35-20068 per ft per ft 2.82$                                            Pentair R18754 Per foot Coil $1.76 No 43081 ea ft 0.85$                              N
40 129 Polysheen Blue-Clarifer 129 Quart Ideal 10-19019 Qt per Qt 7.44$                                            Bio Guard 23721BIO Quart Per Quart $14.00 No GLB 84048 bottle 1 quart 9.50$                              N

41 Pool Pro 450# Alkalinity Increaser (Sodium 
Hydrogen Carbonate)

1 Each no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid Azure 12001022 50lb Pail Per Pail $74.50 No Buckmans 84798 bag 50# 17.50$                            N

42 Pool Pro Calcium Increase 25# 1 Each Ideal 10-08000 25# pail 25# pail 38.30$                                         ChlorGuard 25lb Pail Per Pail $42.50 No Pool Brite 84990 pail 25# 18.00$                            N
43 Pool Pro Super Clarifier 2 Quart Ideal 10-19020 Qt per Qt 14.70$                                         Bio Guard 23742BIO Quart Per Quart $17.00 No Pool Brite 84916 bottle 1 quart 4.00$                              N
44 10-18505 Powder - DPD - 10 Grms - R0870 4 Each Taylor Technologies 10-18505 bottle each 11.00$                                         Taylor R-0870-I 10g. Bottle Per Bottle $14.75 No Taylor 82344 10 gram 5.65$                              N
45 PC2100 PPM Sensor 1 Each no bid add or replace no bid add or replace Chemtrol PPMFC002 Per Each $1,890.00 No Santa Barbara 42196 ea sensor 1,350.00$                      N
46 36-16070 Probe - PH - K&E - Santa Barbara 1 Each santa barbra controls 36-16070 each each 275.00$                                       Chemtrol pH Per Each $320.00 No Santa Barbara 43175 ea sensor 235.00$                         N
47 39-00469 PS DYN Reset USA 2010 1 Each maytronics 39-00469 each each 299.99$                                       No Bid
48 10-18310 Reagent #1 1 Each Taylor Technologies 10-18310 each each 9.00$                                            Taylor R-0001-C 2oz. Bottle Per Each $10.50 No Taylor 82300 bottle .75 oz 2.50$                              N
49 10-18460 Reagent #10 1 Each Taylor Technologies 10-18460 each each 9.00$                                            Taylor R-0010-A 3/4oz. Bottle Per Each $4.75 No Taylor 82330 bottle .75 oz 2.94$                              N
50 10-18480 Reagent #11 - 2oz. 1 Each Taylor Technologies 10-18480 each each 9.00$                                            Taylor R-0011-A 3/4oz. Bottle Per Each $7.50 No Taylor 82334 bottle  2 oz 6.00$                              N
51 10-18500 Reagent #12 - 2oz 2 Each Taylor Technologies 10-18500 each each 9.00$                                            Taylor R-0012-A 3/4oz. Bottle Per Each $6.50 No Taylor 82337 bottle  2 oz 3.80$                              N
52 10-18330 Reagent #2 1 Each Taylor Technologies 10-18330 each each 9.00$                                            Taylor R-0002-C 2oz. Bottle Per Each $10.50 No Taylor 82303 bottle .75 oz 2.50$                              N
53 10-18340 Reagent #3 1 Each Taylor Technologies 10-18360 each each 9.00$                                            Taylor R-0003-C 2oz. Bottle Per Each $10.50 No Taylor 82306 bottle .75 oz 2.90$                              N
54 10-18360 Reagent #4 1 Each Taylor Technologies 10-18360 each each 9.00$                                            Taylor R-0004-C 2oz. Bottle Per Each $10.50 No Taylor 82309 bottle .75 oz 2.73$                              N
55 10-18372 Reagent #5 1 Each Taylor Technologies 10-18385 each each 9.00$                                            Taylor R-0005-A 3/4oz. Bottle Per Each $4.75 No Taylor 82312 bottle .75 oz 2.40$                              N
56 10-18385 Reagent #6 1 Each Taylor Technologies 10-18372 each each 9.00$                                            Taylor R-0006-A 3/4oz. Bottle Per Each $4.75 No Taylor 82315 bottle .75 oz 2.35$                              N
57 10-18400 Reagent #7 1 Each Taylor Technologies 10-18400 each each 9.00$                                            Taylor R-0007-A 3/4oz. Bottle Per Each $4.75 No Taylor 82318 bottle .75 oz 2.41$                              N
58 10-18420 Reagent #8 1 Each Taylor Technologies 10-18420 each each 9.00$                                            Taylor R-0008-A 3/4oz. Bottle Per Each $4.75 No Taylor 82321 bottle .75 oz 2.10$                              N
59 10-18440 Reagent #9 1 Each Taylor Technologies 10-18440 each each 9.00$                                            Taylor R-0009-A 3/4oz. Bottle Per Each $4.75 No Taylor 82324 bottle .75 oz 2.80$                              N
60 39-00506 Retrofit for Cable Conn. - 3 Pin 1 Each maytronics 39-00506 each each 6.48$                                            Retrofit for Cable Conn. - 3 P-9990-T No Bid
61 25-25020 Roller Bearing 2 Each durafirm 25-25020 each each 34.20$                                         Roller B-5551-L No Bid
62 25-25030 Rubber Bumpers 2 Each durafirm 25-25030 each each 30.64$                                         Rubber B-5552-B No Bid
63 84820 Sanitizer/Pool Brite 41 Case 10-03050 gallon 4/1 gal case 4.08$                                            Sanitizer/Pool B-4820482048203-N No Bid Pool Brite 84820 case/box 4 X 1 Case 2.70 per gallon N
64 84480 Shock 12/1 lb bags/Pool Brite 1 Bag Ideal sure shock 10-19040 each 12/13 BAGS 3.78$                                            Bio Guard 22808BIO Case 12/1lb Case $52.50 No Pool Brite 84480 box 12 X 1# bags 27.50$                            N
65 36-16202 Siemens Co2 Solenois Valve ith Fittings 1 Each becs technology 36-16202 each each 266.75$                                       Siemens Co2 Solenois Valve ith F-6665-E No Bid
66 25-25025 Slide Bearing 2 Each durafirm 25-25025 each each 29.38$                                         Slide B-5556-I No Bid
67 10-19055 Soda Ash - 50lb 5 Each 10-19055 50# bag each 36.75$                                         Cinderella SODASH50 50lb Bag Per Each $39.50 No Buckmans 84805 bag 50# 22.80$                            N
68 Sodium Bicarbonate 50 pound bag 41 Bag 10-23036 50# bag each 36.75$                                         Cinderella SODBICARB50 50lb Bag Per Each $36.50 No Buckmans 84798 bag 50# 17.50$                            N
69 Sodium Hypochlorite 670 Gallon 10-03050 1 gallon 4/1 gallon case 4.08$                                            Champion Case 4/1gal Case $14.00 No Bulk 83995 1 gallon bulk bulk 1.49 per gallon N
70 10-03075 Sodium Thiosulfate - 50lb 7 Each 10-03073 50# bag each 110.93$                                       Cinderella SODTHIOS 55lb Bag Per Each $98.75 No Buckmans 84806 bag 50# 35.00$                            N
71 36-16128 T Strainer - Screen for - S.S. - 1 1/2 in 1 Each ipex 36-16128 each each 36.72$                                         IPEX -1-1/2" 304 SS 35 Mesh Screen Screen 4RT19JSS Per Each Per Each $35.00 No
72 Taylor CL FAS DP Kit 3 Each Taylor Technologies 10-20015 each each 85.00$                                         taylor K-2005 K2005 Each $89.00 No Taylor 82021 kit 1 kit 49.90$                            N
73 10-18517 Titration Reagent - 2oz - R-0871 2 Each Taylor Technologies 10-18517 each each 14.50$                                         Taylor Titration Reagent - 2oz - R0871 2oz. Bottle Each $18.99 No Taylor 82347 bottle 2 oz 6.75$                              N
74 36-16116 True Union - Y Check Valve 2 in. 1 Each 16-16116 each each 241.18$                                       IPEX - VR Series VRUV108 Each $226.00 No
75 10-02200 Zappit 73 - 25# 10 Each Axial 10-02200 25# pail each 98.18$                                         Pulsar Power Shock 25lb Pail Per pail $83.00 Yes Axiall 84360 pail 25# 59.00$                            N

NOTE:  THESE ARE ONLY ESTIMATED QUANTITIES.  WHILE ORDERS ARE NOT GUARANTEED, DISTRICT ORDERS ARE EXPECTED TO EXCEED THESE QUANTITIES.
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